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Spring seems to be the season for performance appraisals. 
For decades now employees have been afraid of them and 
managers dread doing them.  In fact earlier this year Google 
scrapped their twice-yearly performance review process in 
order to “improve morale!”

The problem is: most performance appraisals look backwards 
- how was your performance and what can be improved?  The 
backwards approach can damage employee performance 
by up to 27% according to A Quantitative Analysis of the 
Effectiveness of Performance Management Strategies 

https://marble-arch-online-courses.s3.amazonaws.com/CLC_Building_the_High_Performance_Workforce_A_Quantitative_Analysis_of_the_Effectiveness_of_Performance_Management_Strategies1.pdf
https://marble-arch-online-courses.s3.amazonaws.com/CLC_Building_the_High_Performance_Workforce_A_Quantitative_Analysis_of_the_Effectiveness_of_Performance_Management_Strategies1.pdf
https://www.effectory.com/knowledge/hr-analytics-role-clarity-impacts-performance/
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STEP 3 - OFFER ASSISTANCE AND ADVICE 

During the prior step you may hear an opportunity to provide 
advice. 

Ask permission before you give any. 

It sounds like this: 

	» You sounded frustrated by the frequency of change orders - 

may I give you a few tips? 

	» I’ve had those kinds of conversations with inspectors 

EHIRUH��PD\�,�VXJJHVW�VRPHWKLQJ"�

STEP 4 - BRIDGE TO THE FUTURE 

6WHS�IRXU�EHJLQV�WKH�PXWXDOO\�EHQHʳFLDO�DQG�IRUZDUG�ORRNLQJ�
part of the conversation. The recent 2023 Workplace Learning 
Report from LinkedIn Learning declared that only 26% of 
employees say their employer challenged them to learn a 
new skill in the last six months and only 15% said that their 
RUJDQL]DWLRQ�HQFRXUDJHG�WKHP�WR�PRYH�WR�D�QHZ�UROH�

This is discouraging news because it means that many 
employers are not considering how the company will continue 
to grow in the future through its employees. On the bright side 
KRZHYHU��KLJK�SHUIRUPLQJ�HPSOR\HHV�WKULYH�RQ�EHLQJ�DEOH�WR�
LPSURYH�DQG�JURZ���6R��LQ�WKLV�VWHS�\RXU�IRFXV�LV�RQ�KHOSLQJ�
WKH�HPSOR\HH�WR�FRQWLQXH�WR�JURZ��OHDUQ��DQG�FRQWULEXWH�WR�WKH�
RUJDQL]DWLRQ�

You can accomplish this through any of these open-ended 
questions:

	» :KHQ�LW�FRPHV�WR�\RXU�ZRUN��ZKDWȤV�RQH�WKLQJ�\RX�ZRXOG�

like to improve on or something that you could do better if 

you had more training or practice?

	» What are your strengths and how do you apply them on the 

MRE"

	» What are two or three ways you think you can (or would like 

to) grow in this role? 

	» What are you learning right now? (Note: If the response 

is something “personal” ask them about it; you may gain 

insight into what they are passionate about.)

	» What would you like to learn about the business?

	» Are you interested in moving to another department to 

learn more about the business? 

It is important for managers to provide employees with 
D�VHQVH�RI�FKRLFH��,Q�GRLQJ�VR��\RX�FUHDWH�DQ�HQYLURQPHQW�
that encourages employees to take ownership of their work 
DQG�FRQWULEXWLRQV��ZKLFK�LQ�WXUQ�KHOSV�WR�PRYH�WKH�ZKROH�
RUJDQL]DWLRQ�IRUZDUG�

NOTE: ,I�\RX�DUH�DQ�HPSOR\HH�UHDGLQJ�WKLV�DUWLFOH��EH�
accountable for your own development by telling your 
PDQDJHU�\RXU�JRDOV��DVNLQJ�IRU�VSHFLʳF�OHDUQLQJ�RSSRUWXQLWLHV�
ȡ�ERWK�ZLWKLQ�WKH�RUJDQL]DWLRQ�DQG�RXWVLGH�RI�LW��DQG�OLQNLQJ�
what you want to learn and accomplish to the success of the 
RUJDQL]DWLRQ�

Performance reviews shouldn’t be a daunting process but 
UDWKHU�SDUW�RI�DQ�RQJRLQJ�FRQYHUVDWLRQ�WKDW�SULRULWL]HV�JURZWK�
DQG�GHYHORSPHQW�ȡ�ERWK�IRU�WKH�RUJDQL]DWLRQ�DQG�IRU�WKH�
individual.  When you take this “forward looking” approach to 
SHUIRUPDQFH�UHYLHZV��\RX�ZLOO�VHH�\RXU�HPSOR\HHV�EHFRPH�
HQHUJL]HG�WR�WDNH�RQ�QHZ�UHVSRQVLELOLWLHV�DQG�FRQWULEXWH�WR�WKH�
RUJDQL]DWLRQ�LQ�QHZ�DQG�LQQRYDWLYH�ZD\V���ZKLFK�LV�FULWLFDO�IRU�
survival in the 21st century.

https://learning.linkedin.com/resources/workplace-learning-report?src=go-pa&trk=sem-ga_campid.12612599681_asid.123631661727_crid.647037612424_kw.workplace%20learning%20report_d.c_tid.kwd-1173743060144_n.g_mt.p_geo.9052011&mcid=6841846450872315944&cid=&gclid=CjwKCAiAu5agBhBzEiwAdiR5tIWDuoVKCQa-TqJSX6YHWBvnLPKaofH_KR6XPqeJ1heXN7p8bzLEcRoCluIQAvD_BwE&gclsrc=aw.ds
https://learning.linkedin.com/resources/workplace-learning-report?src=go-pa&trk=sem-ga_campid.12612599681_asid.123631661727_crid.647037612424_kw.workplace%20learning%20report_d.c_tid.kwd-1173743060144_n.g_mt.p_geo.9052011&mcid=6841846450872315944&cid=&gclid=CjwKCAiAu5agBhBzEiwAdiR5tIWDuoVKCQa-TqJSX6YHWBvnLPKaofH_KR6XPqeJ1heXN7p8bzLEcRoCluIQAvD_BwE&gclsrc=aw.ds
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